

#	Company Name	OPIS Bid Mark up Price per gallon- Diesel	Firm Fixed Price- 3/1/2020 -8/31/2020	OPIS Bid Mark Up Price per gallon- Gasoline	Firm Fixed Price-3/1/2020- 8/31/2020
1	<b>Glassmere</b>	\$0.0297	No bid	\$0.0297	No bid
	Option	\$0.0327	No bid	\$0.0327	No bid
2	<b>Lykins</b>	\$0.0241	No bid	\$0.0686	No bid
	Option	\$0.0241	No bid	\$0.0686	No bid
3	<b>Petroleum Traders</b>	\$0.0147	\$2.0499	\$0.0188	\$1.9951
	Option	\$0.0147	\$2.0162	\$0.0188	\$1.8359